

Invoice #: 418512

July 2, 2024

Date	Tkpr	Description of Service	Hours
6/15/24	PSS	Email with Mr. Long [REDACTED].	.20
6/17/24	PSS	Tele conference [REDACTED].	.40
6/17/24	PSS	Email to Mr. Roberts re: need for additional specificity in mediation demand and rejecting demand to pay \$12,000 of attorneys' fees upfront.	.10
6/18/24	PSS	Email with Mr. Long [REDACTED].	.10
6/18/24	PSS	Draft Response to Motion to Compel and for Contempt (Argument).	1.70
6/18/24	PSS	Tele conference with Gravis Law [REDACTED].	.10
6/19/24	PSS	Review and Revise Response to Motion to Compel and for Contempt.	.60
6/19/24	PSS	Draft declaration of Gary Long in support of Response to Motion for Contempt.	.40
6/19/24	PSS	Email to Mr. Long [REDACTED].	.10
6/20/24	PSS	Tele conference with Mr. Long [REDACTED].	.30
6/20/24	PSS	Finalize Opposition to Motion to Compel and for Contempt.	.30
6/20/24	PSS	Draft declaration of counsel and compile supporting exhibits.	.50
6/20/24	WNP	Draft Motion to Dismiss (Introduction).	.50
6/20/24	WNP	Draft Motion to Dismiss (Statement of Facts).	1.00
6/20/24	WNP	Review Washington case law [REDACTED].	.60
6/21/24	AK	Researched [REDACTED].	3.40
6/21/24	PSS	Finalize declarations and Response Brief.	.80
6/21/24	PSS	Draft Motion for Leave to File Overlength Brief.	.40
6/21/24	PSS	Email with Mr. Long re: [REDACTED].	.20
6/24/24	PSS	Review correspondence from Plaintiff's counsel re: continuing hearing date and request for depositions of Messrs. Long and Parker.	.10
6/24/24	PSS	Email to Mr. Long [REDACTED].	.20
6/24/24	PSS	Email to Mr. Roberts re: opposition to depositions of Messrs. Parker and Long.	.20
6/24/24	TJN	Review recent emails and filings on case	.30
6/24/24	TJN	Discuss matter with Paul Stewart; further review of emails and communications on Plaintiffs' intent to depose clients; [REDACTED].	1.50
6/25/24	PSS	Email [REDACTED].	.20
6/25/24	PSS	Confer with attorney Nault [REDACTED].	.20
6/25/24	TJN	Review client emails [REDACTED].	.20
6/26/24	PSS	Email with Mr. Long [REDACTED].	.10

Invoice #: 418512

July 2, 2024

Date	Tkpr	Description of Service	Hours
6/26/24	PSS	Tele conference with Mr. Long [REDACTED]	.20
6/28/24	PSS	Draft Motion to Dismiss (Argument).	.50
TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES			\$ 5,750.00

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL SERVICES

Name	Title	Hours	Rate	Total
Nathaniel Post	Associate	.60	250.00	150.00
Timothy J Nault	Special Counsel	4.80	300.00	1,440.00
Paul S. Stewart	Partner	12.80	325.00	4,160.00
TOTALS		18.20		\$ 5,750.00

TOTAL THIS INVOICE \$ 5,750.00